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Alerts

1 event
54 results matching for 'Innovation Patents Open to Public Inspection' during February 2012.
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2010101481 Mobile Phone Alert Device 01 Feb 2012

2011101205 Accessory and mobile computing device communication using an application
communication protocol

01 Feb 2012

2011101696 Coriolis energy generator 01 Feb 2012

2011101582 Storage handle and bag 01 Feb 2012

2006101104 Automatic vending machine 01 Feb 2012

2011101546 Article control system 01 Feb 2012

2011101562 Compact offroad dynamic lifting apparatus 01 Feb 2012

2011101702 A drug dispensing system 01 Feb 2012

2011101692 EziBeep 01 Feb 2012

2011101583 Active rollover prevention system for construction and road machines 01 Feb 2012

2011101691 An earpiece apparatus for hygienically assisting the selection of an earring prior to
purchase

01 Feb 2012

2008101287 Integrated Energy System Solar Hydrogen Steampower 01 Feb 2012

2011101664 Water Treatment System 01 Feb 2012

2011101690 Improved Key-less Chuck 01 Feb 2012

2011101695 Insulation 01 Feb 2012

2008101288 An improved Z section structural member 01 Feb 2012

2011101672 Magnetic stretch toy figure 01 Feb 2012

2011101611 Multi-mode charging of hierarchical anode 01 Feb 2012

2011101679 PIR sensor with retractable controls 01 Feb 2012

2011101578 Temporal task-based tab management 01 Feb 2012

2011101579 Selective rendering of off-screen content 01 Feb 2012

2011101697 Tri-Cell Lumbar Support Travel Pillow and Foot Rest 01 Feb 2012

2011101667 Fixed structure for faucets and bathroom accessories 01 Feb 2012

2011101673 Decking Gauge 01 Feb 2012

2011101660 An Integrated Solar Air Conditioning System 01 Feb 2012

2011101492 Dropin klikdrain 50mm 40mm 32mm 01 Feb 2012

2011101589 Tripper unit 01 Feb 2012

2011101686 A system for, and a method of, providing information associated with working conditions
of a workplace

01 Feb 2012

2011101353 Method of capturing stranded natural gas and flare gas energy by means of redox
electrolyte transfer

01 Feb 2012

2011101683 Rail Transport Management System 01 Feb 2012

2011101699 Single module double pole multifunction RCBO 01 Feb 2012

2011101397 A Rotary Welding System 01 Feb 2012

2012100002 Vacant passenger seat locator 01 Feb 2012

2011101605 Water filter and alert assembly for bathroom use 01 Feb 2012

2012100007 Mat 01 Feb 2012

2011101687 Metal detector for salt soils 01 Feb 2012

2011101689 Metal detector with improved magnetic soil response cancellation 01 Feb 2012
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2011101571 Intermodal Container 01 Feb 2012

2010101482 Trap for insects 01 Feb 2012

2011101701 Generalized Solution for Generating Stepper Motor Speed Profiles in Real Time 01 Feb 2012

2011101669 Dual Range Drivetrain for Extended Drivetrain Cycles 01 Feb 2012

2011101246 Victolya Method and Process of Forming Relationships and Linking Data for Information
Resource Knowledge Management

01 Feb 2012

2011101677 Utility Receptacle for Vehicles 01 Feb 2012

2012100014 Frame for rapid building system 01 Feb 2012

2011101680 Computer-Implemented Method of Designing Security Documents 01 Feb 2012

2011101430 Solar fusion generator 01 Feb 2012

2011101534 Door Operator 01 Feb 2012

2011101386 A stand 01 Feb 2012

2011101693 A method and system for allowing a user to make a plurality of offers to a plurality of
advertisers

01 Feb 2012

2011101688 Combined greenhouse 01 Feb 2012

2011101031 Language easy 01 Feb 2012

2011101598 A pivoting panel assembly 01 Feb 2012

2011101700 Multi-Protocol HAN adapter 01 Feb 2012

2012100006 Flush toilet cover plate connecting structure 01 Feb 2012
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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